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The Wave of the Future

NOTICE OF CLAIM

DATE: June 23, 2020

TO: Doug Petraszak, Linda Staffaroni and Joan Lowe

FROM: Cassie Smith-Gregor

RE: Claim from Betty Luzenski requesting reimbursement for time and materials for

damage that occurred to her mailbox caused by a snowplow.

This claim will be presented to the County Board at their July 21, 2020
meeting.



Gregor, Cassie

From: Luzenski, Betty J <betty.luzenski@usbank.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 24, 2020 12:29 PM

To: Gregor, Cassie

Subject: RE: Reimbursement for mailbox

The snow plow knocked down our mailbox | believe it was January 22, 2020. We had to stop our mail until my husband
could fix it on January 26. | called you and you had someone come to look atit. We live on a horseshoe road. We live
on Parkwood Drive which horseshoes with Beuhring Road. The plow likes to come around the curve and try to push the
snow into our ditch. This was the third time that he clipped our mailbox with his plow. The marks on the mailbox are
from the plow. My husband has bolted 2 x 4’s on twice but the post is getting destroyed and we need a new one. There
is no reason that the plow needs to get that close to the mailbox. There are only a few people who live on our road and
my husband always clears the snow away from the mailbox.

Betty J Luzenski
Wealth Management Trust Associate
p. 920.424.4202 | betty.luzenski@usbank.com

U.S. Bank
Oshkosh
111 N Main St, Oshkosh, W1 54901-2448 | MK-WI-2033 | www.usbank.com

From: Gregor, Cassie <CGregor@co.winnebago.wi.us>
Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 9:58 AM

To: Luzenski, Betty J <betty.luzenski@usbank.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Reimbursement for mailbox

Good morning,
Please give me a detailed description of the actual event. Time, place, what happened etc.

Thank you.

From: Luzenski, Betty J <betty.luzenski@usbank.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 9:38 AM

To: Gregor, Cassie <CGregor@co.winnebago.wi.us>
Subject: FW: Reimbursement for mailbox

Hello Cassie,

I had called you regarding our mailbox that the snowplow had knocked down. My husband finally has purchased a new
post. | have attached some pictures and receipt for the post. My husband would also liked to be reimbursed for his
time and materials for having to repair the post twice before. This is the third time that the snowplow has knocked our
mailbox down. He would like $40 for the materials and his time and $40 for the new post. Our address is:

Betty Luzenski
1739 Parkwood Drive
Oshkosh, WI 54904



FleetIFFarm

Fleet Farm
177 N. Mashburn Road
Dshiash, WI 54904
(920)231-5738

5420720 10:09 AM

Trans. @ 4485 Store: 01700

Reg.: 001 Titl: 001

Cashier B: 81173 sales #: 81173
SALE

AR

0170000144352

pOST 33.99 T
Nd6ABZ027506 x 1 38.99
peturn Value 38.99 each

subtotal 38.99

Total Sales Tax 1.95

Total 40.94
Gift Card 40.94

Account: 0406
Auth: 149269 (A)
Ralance Available: 43.99
Change Due (.00

Nember of Ttems Sold: 1

FleetdFFarm
SAVE on Valvoline Oil Changes!

$2495

CONVENTIONAL

> =

= .‘5»495

FULL SYNTHETIC

{includes 5-gts, Defanse Uit Fllor and Vabicls Inspection}
Vadd luna 10 - 21, 2020, Texas snd faes satra.

Schedule your appointment online today!

NOW HIRINGE
10% Faployee Discount
Apply @ jobs. fleetfarm.com

Customer Copy

for returns 30 days fram purchase date

W v, “or shopping at Fleet Farm.












