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The Wave of the Future

NOTICE OF CLAIM

Date: April 2, 2020
To: Doug, Linda and Joan
Re: Claim from Heather and Steve Ebert for damage to their dock that occurred on

02/17/2020 from a Winnebago County grater. (The County Clerk office has
requested a copy and still waiting for the estimate for the repair of the dock.)

This claim will be presented to the County Board at their April 28, 2020
meeting.



Gregor, Cassie

From: Heather Ebert <sweetheathersings@msn.com>
Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 4:54 PM

To: Ertmer, Sue

Subject: Re: 7205 County Rd H

Hello Sue,

| will have my husband find the cheapest dock to replace, which | believe is on Craigslist. I'm regards to repairing the
dock with the safe and shelter imposed by the state | doubt any dock sales or repair places are deemed essential, so
what would be your suggestion be, as it was one of YOUR employees wrecked OUR dock.

7205 County Rd H
Fremont, W1 54940
715-281-8293

Heather
Sent from my iPhone

> On Mar 30, 2020, at 4:29 PM, Ertmer, Sue <SErtmer@co.winnebago.wi.us> wrote:

>

> Thank you, Heather.

>

> I'll need you to send me a copy of the estimate for repair of the dock. | will also need your phone number and mailing
address. When | get that information, I'll print out the pictures and set up a file for your claim.

> From: Heather Ebert <sweetheathersings@msn.com>

> Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 4:22 PM

> To: Ertmer, Sue <SErtmer@co.winnebago.wi.us>

> Subject: 7205 County Rd H

>

> Attached are pictures of our damaged dock that was struck on February 17th at 10:30am by Winnebago County grater.
| was home and was looking out the window when | watched him hit our dock and kept driving east on Cty Rd H. | called
in and talked to Jeremy and he asked me to email him pictures, which | did. He told me he would come out and look at
himself and get back to me. After a few weeks | never heard anything from him and finally, after calling him many times,
he got back to me last week. | was told to call Doug, which | have done. He told me | needed to reach out to you. | had
my husband get an estimate of similar 64 foot dock and the cheapest he can find is $8000. Please feel free to come out
and look at the dock as we will not being doing anything with it until this has been resolved. Please let me know once
you have received my email. You can reach me at 715-281-8293.

>

> Heather and Steve Ebert

> FILED

MAR 5U 2020

WINNEBAGO COUNTY
CLERKS OFFICE
WINNEBAGO. WI




Gregor, Cassie

From: Heather Ebert <sweetheathersings@msn.com>

Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 4:22 PM

To: Ertmer, Sue

Subject: 7205 County Rd H

Attachments: 20200330_151742.JPG; ATTO0001.txt; 20200330_151806.JPG; ATT00002.txt; 20200330_

151759_resized.JPG; ATT00003.txt; 20200330_151749_resized.JPG; ATT00004 txt

Attached are pictures of our damaged dock that was struck on February 17th at 10:30am by Winnebago County grater. |
was home and was looking out the window when | watched him hit our dock and kept driving east on Cty Rd H. | called
in and talked to Jeremy and he asked me to email him pictures, which | did. He told me he would come out and look at
himself and get back to me. After a few weeks | never heard anything from him and finally, after calling him many times,
he got back to me last week. | was told to call Doug, which | have done. He told me | needed to reach out to you. | had
my husband get an estimate of similar 64 foot dock and the cheapest he can find is $8000. Please feel free to come out
and look at the dock as we will not being doing anything with it until this has been resolved. Please let me know once
you have received my email. You can reach me at 715-281-8293.

Heather and Steve Ebert















Gregor, Cassie

From: Heather Ebert <sweetheathersings@msn.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2020 9:39 AM

To: Ertmer, Sue

Subject: Fwd: dock

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Ebert, Steve M." <Steve.Ebert@waupacafoundry.com>
Date: March 30, 2020 at 7:58:15 PM CDT

To: Heather Ebert <sweetheathersings@msn.com>

Subject: dock

With tax and delivery — will round up to $8000 for two sections 32’ each which would then equal the 64’
we have now.



Aluminum Roll in Dock - $3520 (Cromwell)

image 1 of 4

2020 Aluma Lite Dock

New 32' with an 8' L Aluminum Roll in dock with Maintenance free Vinyl
winter storage. Large plastic wheels for easy roll in. All docks come with w
several other dock sizes, ramps and benches available and in stock for an ac
Shipping available

Visit our website at www.soderbloom.com or call us today at 218-644-339.



Steve Ebert

Director of Quality Assurance Waupaca Foundry
Office — 715 258 6762

Cell-715412 1214
Steve.ebert@waupacafoundry.com

CONFIDENTIALITY AND LEGAL NOTICE

This electronic mail transmission is confidential, may be privileged and should be read or retained only by the intended recipient. If the reader of
this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any distribution or copying hereof is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this transmission in error, please immediately notify the sender and remove it from your system. E-mail is not necessarily a secure
communication method, therefore the sender shall not be responsible for any changes that occur during its transfer. All e-mails are scanned for
viruses, however, files attached to this e-mail may contain viruses that could harm the systems of the recipient. Any opinions expressed in this
email must be confirmed in writing and signed by the sender to have legal validity.



Gregor, Cassie

From: Heather Ebert <sweetheathersings@msn.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 9:22 AM

To: Ertmer, Sue

Subject: Re: 7205 County Rd H

Good morning Sue,
Just wondering what our next steps are? Can you please let us know?

Thank you
Heather and Steve Ebert

Sent from my iPhone

> 0On Mar 30, 2020, at 4:29 PM, Ertmer, Sue <SErtmer@co.winnebago.wi.us> wrote:

>

> Thank you, Heather.

>

> I'll need you to send me a copy of the estimate for repair of the dock. | will also need your phone number and mailing
address. When | get that information, I'll print out the pictures and set up a file for your claim.

> From: Heather Ebert <sweetheathersings@msn.com>

> Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 4:22 PM

> To: Ertmer, Sue <SErtmer@co.winnebago.wi.us>

> Subject: 7205 County Rd H

>

> Attached are pictures of our damaged dock that was struck on February 17th at 10:30am by Winnebago County grater.
I was home and was looking out the window when | watched him hit our dock and kept driving east on Cty Rd H. | called
in and talked to Jeremy and he asked me to email him pictures, which | did. He told me he would come out and look at
himself and get back to me. After a few weeks | never heard anything from him and finally, after calling him many times,
he got back to me last week. | was told to call Doug, which | have done. He told me | needed to reach out to you. | had
my husband get an estimate of similar 64 foot dock and the cheapest he can find is $8000. Please feel free to come out
and look at the dock as we will not being doing anything with it until this has been resolved. Please let me know once
you have received my email. You can reach me at 715-281-8293.

>

> Heather and Steve Ebert

>



